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 Professors  and teachers  of  the  department  have established cooperation  with  a  number  of  higher
educational institutions, institutes for advanced training and retraining of personnel in the country. In
particular, the main higher education institutions: Research is carried out in cooperation with professors
and specialists of the Tashkent State Pedagogical University named after Nizami, Namangan Engineering
and Pedagogical Institute, the Institute for Advanced Studies and Retraining of Secondary Specialized and
Professional Education. The tutorials are collaborative. In addition, there are about 30 vocational and
technical colleges at the institute, as well as 2 academic lyceums at the institute.

In  the  field  of  innovative  cooperation  at  the  department  of  Kibray  Agricultural  Professional  College,
Yangiyul  Agricultural  Professional  College,  Kibray Energy Professional  College,  Professional  College of
Geodesy and Cartography, the professional college of hydrometeorology, Buka agro-industrial professional
colleges, the city of Tashkent and the Tashkent regional department of secondary specialized education
have signed agreements and work is underway on the obligations under the agreement.

During the 2018-2019 academic year, an agreement was signed on cooperation with the Department of
Pedagogy,  Psychology  of  the  Syrdarya  University  of  Kazakhstan,  the  Federal  State  Autonomous
Educational  Institution  and  the  Russian  State  Professional  Pedagogical  University.  According  to  the
agreement, in July the journal "Sustainabli Agriculture" will publish an article "The practice of studying the
discipline" Methods of vocational training " in the universities of the Republic of Uzbekistan".

During  the  year  in  the  international  scientific  journals  of  the  Russian  Federation  "Secondary  vocational
education", "Higher school", "School of the future", "Journal of scientific and applied research" professors
and teachers of the department, independent doctoral students, independent students. Professors and
talented students published articles in domestic and foreign scientific journals, as well as at international
scientific and practical conferences in Chelyabinsk, Chita, Samara, Moscow. Currently, cooperation with the
German government, the study and analysis of foreign literature, the introduction of topics from foreign
literature  in  general  and  specialized  disciplines  of  bachelor's  degree  in  vocational  education,  the
development of curricula.


